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Control No: 21-21912-9

Medical Record Excerpt & Outline

Patient Name : Floreen Rooks
WCAB # : SIF7024643, SIF10825285,SIF7024645
Social Security No. : 000-00-0000
Date of Birth : 06/20/49
Employer : Dveal Family & Youth Services
Records of : State Compensation Insurance Fund

Glendale, CA
Date of Injury : 11/10/2007

Date of 
Service

Page
No. Provider Excerpt

11/16/07 |75, |85 WC Claim Form (DWC 1)
DOI: 11/10/07. Hx of injury: Employee fell onto ground and 
gravel and fractured right foot to prevent rolling car from 
entering into oncoming traffic. 

11/20/07 |239-|244, 
|255-|256, 
|259-|262, 
|281-|282

Hadley, Michael, 
M.D.-HealthCare 
Partners 

Dr's 1st Rept of Occupational Injury/Illness
Hx of injury: “Fell on to ground gravel and fractured right 
foot to prevent from rolling into oncoming traffic injured 
right foot”. CC: On 11/10/07 while trying to enter the vehicle 
that was moving even though it was parked she tripped on 
the ground and fell, she hit her left knee and she twisted her 
left ankle and also her right foot. Because of these injuries, 
patient developed her left ankle and also her right foot. 
Because of these injuries, patient developed pain mostly in 
her right foot. As a result, she went to the Kaiser ER for 
evaluation and treatment. While at Kaiser ER she was told 
that she had a fracture of the right foot, sprain to the left 
ankle and a bruise to the left knee. She was given an ortho 
shoe and was told to report this to her employer as a job-
related injury. Patient did so and she was referred here by her 
Workers Compensation insurance carrier for evaluation and 
treatment. Today is her initial visit at this facility. Patient 
does complain of mild discomfort in her left ankle and her 
left knee. However, she does complain of significant 
discomfort in her right foot. BP: 156/98. PMH: Patient states 
that she has a heart valve problem for many years and does 



use prophylactic antibiotics for dental work. She has had a 
fracture of her left ankle in 1992 that was treated operatively. 
Allergies: She is allergic to PCN. Social habits: Tobacco use. 
Exam: Right foot revealed that there is moderate to marked 
tenderness prevent on the do sum. Patient patient does have 
impaired weightbearing secondary to pain and altered gait 
secondary to pain. Patient is ambulating with the aid of a 
cane. Examination of the left ankle reveals that there is a 
healed surgical scar. There is trace tenderness and edema. 
Examination of the left knee reveals vague tenderness 
present anteriorly, trace edema. There is full flexion with 
pain. Preliminary reading of the right foot reveals that there 
is a fracture involving the fourth and fifth metatarsals with 
angulation present in the fourth metatarsal head. Final report 
is pending. X-ray exam of the left ankle reveals the presence 
of hardware, no acute finding seen. X-ray of the left knee is 
unremarkable except for degenerative changes. Final report 
is pending. Dx: Contusion, left knee. Fracture, right foot. 
Sprain, left ankle. Patient does have hardware in her left 
ankle and this may impact upon her rate of recovery. Tx: 
Motrin 800 mg. Tylenol. Tx plan: X-ray. Dispensed walker 
boot/Cam walker. Recommendation: Referral to orthopedic 
surgeon for evaluation and treatment. RTW/modified duty. 
Restrictions: No driving vehicle during working hours, no 
walking or standing for more than one hour, sitting work 
only. 

11/20/07 |367 HealthCare Partners Radiology/Diagnostics
X-ray of Right Foot, Left Ankle and Left Knee. X-ray of 
Right Foot: Findings: There is minimally displaced 
comminuted fracture of the distal fourth metatarsal. In 
addition, there is a nondisplaced fracture of the shaft of the 
fifth metatarsal seen best in the oblique view. The remaining 
visualized osseous structures and joint spaces are intact. The 
fractures do not appear to extend into adjacent 
metatarsophalangeal joints. Impression: 1) Fractures of the 
fourth and fifth metatarsals as described above. 2) Abnormal 
report. X-ray of Left Ankle: Findings: There are post-
operative findings of metallic plate and surgical screws in the 
distal fibula and two screws in the distal tibia in place. No 
acute fracture or dislocation is identified. There is significant 
degenerative narrowing of the ankle mortise. Impression: 
Post-operative findings in the distal tibia and fibula as 
described above. There is significant degenerative narrowing 
of the ankle mortise. X-ray of Left Knee: Impression: 1) Mild 
osteoarthrosis in the left knee. 2) Questionable 0.8 cm loose 
body. 



12/20/07 |326-|327, 
|344-|345, 
|351-|352

Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D. 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
Patient has been under our care with a diagnosis of a fracture 
of her right fourth and fifth metatarsal. She has been using a 
Cars walker and indicates that her pain has steadily 
improved. Patient has also complained of pain and 
discomfort of her left knee and her left ankle, which she 
indicates has been improving subjectively since her last visit. 
Exam: Right foot: There is evidence of mild tenderness. 
There is mild swelling. Left knee: Reveals evidence of mild 
tenderness. Left ankle: Reveals evidence of mild tenderness 
in the anterolateral aspect of the ankle. X-rays of the right 
foot reveal evidence of a healing fourth and fifth metatarsal 
fracture, overall good position. Dx: Healing right fourth and 
fifth metatarsal fracture. Left knee sprain. Left ankle sprain. 
Discussion: I will recommend that patient at this time 
continue off of work. I will encourage her to continue the use 
of a Cam walker to allow the fractures to heal. A knee 
immobilizer will be provided for her left knee and I will 
recommend that she weightbearing as tolerated with the 
assistive devices. I will maintain her off of work and I would 
like to see her back for f/u in four weeks' time, at which time 
x-rays will be taken to assess the healing fractures. 

12/20/07 |374 Health Care Partners Radiology/Diagnostics
X-ray of Right Foot. Clinical Indication: F/u fracture. 
Comparison: Comparison is made to prior radiographs of the 
right foot performed on 11/20/07. Findings: There are 
healing fractures involving the distal fourth metatarsal and 
the distal shaft of the fifth metatarsal. There is near anatomic 
alignment of the fourth metatarsal fracture. There is good 
anatomic alignment of the fifth metatarsal fracture. The rest 
of the examination is rather unremarkable. Impression: 
Healing fractures of the fourth and fifth metatarsals. 

01/17/08 |346-|348 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Specialists 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
This patient has sustained a fracture of her right fourth and 
fifth metatarsals. He also has an injury to her left knee as 
well as her left ankle. She indicates that her right foot pain 
has steadily improved, however, she c/o pain especially of 
her left knee with swelling and effusion of the knee, 
difficulty with squatting, kneeling and climbing activities. 
She also c/o soreness of her left ankle. Exam: Right foot: 
There is evidence of tenderness over the dorsal aspect of the 
fourth and fifth metatarsal. Minimal swelling is noted. Left 
knee: Reveals evidence of notable swelling. There is a small 
effusion, medial joint line tenderness; she flexes the knee 
from 0 to 110 degrees with noticeable pain and discomfort. 
Positive McMurray's sign. Positive Apley's sign is noted. 



Left ankle: Reveals evidence of mildly diffuse medial and 
lateral malleolar area swelling. X-rays of the right foot was 
reviewed. Impression: Impression: 1) Healing right fourth 
and fifth metatarsal fracture. 2) Left knee internal 
derangement. 3) Left ankle sprain. Discussion: At this time, 
it is quite apparent that patient right foot fractures appear to 
be healing quite well. I will recommend that we continue 
conservative measures utilizing the twit walker to allow the 
fractures to heal. She will be given an appointment for four 
weeks, at which time x-rays will be repeated to assess the 
healing fracture consolidation with respect to her left knee, 
there is notable swellin3 and effusion of her left knee and 
findings consistent with a possible cartilage or meniscal tear; 
therefore an MRI of left knee will be requested and ordered 
at this point in time. I will continue her off work as a result 
of these injuries. With respect to her left ankle, I will 
recommend she continue on an aggressive exercise program, 
continua use of Tylenol for pain and discomfort, and I will 
see her back for fallow-up in four weeks' time to assess her 
progress. 

01/17/08 |366 Health Care Partners Radiology/Diagnostics
X-ray of Right Foot. Clinical Indication: F/u fracture. 
Comparison: Comparison is made to prior radiographs of the 
right foot performed on 12/20/07. Findings: There is 
continued healing of fractures involving the distal fourth and 
fifth metatarsals. The remaining visualized bony structures 
and joint spaces appear to be intact. Impression: 1) No 
significant interval changes. 2) There is continued healing of 
fracture involving the fourth and fifth metatarsalis. 

02/21/08 |316-|317, 
|336-|337, 
|342-|343, 
|356-|357, 
|360-|361

Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Specialists 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
As you are well aware, this patient has sustained a fracture of 
her right foot consistent with a fracture of the fourth and fifth 
metatarsals. She also has sustained a left ankle sprain and a 
left knee injury, and most recently her left knee pain has 
steadily gotten worse. This has progressively gotten worse 
and it appears that as a result of favoring her RLE and 
putting all of the weight on bet contralateral extremity, the 
pain has steadily gotten worse as a result of the initial injury 
as well as the underlying degenerative osteoarthritic changes 
from which patient already suffers. Exam: Right foot: There 
is evidence of mild tenderness. There is mild swelling. Left 
knee: Reveals evidence of medial joint line tenderness. There 
is notable swelling. There is notable effusion. Positive grind 
sign. Positive Apley sign. Positive McMurray's sign. X-rays 
of the right foot was reviewed. Impression: 1) Healing right 
fourth and fifth metatarsal fracture. 2) Left knee internal 



derangement. Discussion: It appears quite evident that this 
patient has developed an increased level of pain and 
discomfort of her left knee as a result of favoring her RLE. 
She initially incurred the injury of the left knee as well; 
however, it was certainly not as painful as it is now. I will 
recommend that an MRI of left knee be ordered at the 
soonest possible time, although this apparently has already 
been denied due to lack of the ability to communicate with 
my office; however, that appears to be erroneous since I am 
always available either by cell phone or in our office. If you 
deem it necessary to communicate with any review of 
service, I would be more than happy to do so. With respect to 
her right foot, it appears to be healing well and I an hopeful 
this will heal uneventfully. I would like to reexamine her in 
four weeks' time and I will continue her off of work until 
further progress is made. 

02/21/08 |355, |359 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-HealthCare 
Partners 

Referral Slip
Recommendation: MRI of left knee. 

02/21/08 |373 Health Care Partners Radiology/Diagnostics
X-ray of Right Foot. Clinical Indication: F/u fracture. 
Comparison: Comparison is made to prior radiographs of the 
right foot performed on 01/17/06. There is continued healing 
of fractures involving the distal fourth and fifth metatarsals. 
There is near anatomic alignment cf the fracture fragments of 
the fourth metatarsal fracture. Impression: Continued healing 
of fractures involving the fourth and fifth metatarsals. 

03/19/08 |368-|369, 
|371-|372

HealthCare Partners Radiology/Diagnostics
MRI of Left Knee. Clinical indications: Rule out internal 
derangement. No known surgery. Impression: 1) Tear, 
posterior born, medial meniscus (Grade III). 2) Early 
osteoarthritic changes of the medial compartment of the knee 
joint. 3) Knee joint effusion. 

03/20/08 |340-|341 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Specialists 

Orthopedic Re-Examination
This patient has sustained a fracture of her right foot 
involving the fourth and fifth metatarsal and at this time 
indicates that she has no pain or discomfort. She also has no 
significant pain of her left ankle; however, she continues to 
complain of left knee pain. As a result, an MRI of left knee 
has been ordered. The MRI reveals evidence of a tear of the 
posterior aspect of the medial meniscus. There is also 
evidence of mild early osteoarthritic degenerative arthritic 
changes of the left knee probably in the medial compartment 
and a knee effusion. Exam: Left knee: Reveals evidence of 
notable swelling. There is tenderness. There is an effusion. 
There is positive Apley sign, positive McMurray's sign, and 



positive grind sign. She flexes the knee from 0 to 125 
degrees with noticeable pain. Impression: 1) Left knee 
internal derangement with evidence of medial meniscus tear. 
2) Right fourth and fifth metatarsal fracture, healed. 3) Left 
ankle sprain. Discussion: I will recommend that patient at 
this time continue off of work given her pain and discomfort 
of her left knee. I will request authorization and approval for 
surgery arthroscopically of her left knee, which will be done 
as an outpatient. I will maintain her off of work until further 
progress is made. I will see her back for f/u in 3-4 weeks 
time to assess her progress. With respect to her right foot and 
her left ankle, she can and has responded favorably to 
conservative measures. On this basis, she will be released to 
her previous level of occupation with no restrictions. 

03/20/08 |370 Health Scan Partners Radiology/Diagnostics
X-ray of Right Foot: Clinical Indication: F/u fracture. 
Impression: Continued healing of fourth and fifth metatarsal 
fractures. 

04/17/08 |338-|339 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Specialists 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
Patient has been under our care. She has been treated for a 
fracture of her right foot. The fracture at this time has healed 
completely. She has no pain or discomfort. However, she 
does continue to complain of left knee pain primarily with 
activities of squatting, kneeling and climbing. She has 
minimal soreness and discomfort of her left ankle; otherwise, 
she notes pain increasing of the left ankle when she is 
required to stand for prolor.ged periods of time. Exam: Left 
knee: Reveals evidence of medial joint line tenderness. There 
is notable swelling. There is positive effusion, positive 
McMurray's sign, and positive Apley sign. Left ankle: 
Reveals evidence of limited ROM of the ankle. She 
dorsiflexes the ankle to 10 degrees. She plantar flexes the 
ankle to 25 degrees. Impression: 1) Healed right foot fourth 
and fifth metatarsal fracture. 2) Left knee internal 
derangement with evidence of medial meniscus tear. 3) Left 
ankle post-op degenerative osteoarthritic changes with 
limited ROM. Discussion: At this time, it is quite apparent 
that patient at this time is focusing primarily on her left knee 
injury. An MRI has revealed evidence of a medial meniscus 
tear and she will be scheduled for surgery arthroscopically of 
her left knee on 04/24/08. She understands the risks and 
benefits and wishes this to be done. We will treat her 
conservatively for her right foot as well as her left ankle. I 
will maintain her off of work. I will see her pre-operatively 
in my office on 04/23/08, at which time she will undergo pre-
op evaluation and treatment before surgery on 04/24/08. 



04/24/08 |253-|254, 
|257-|258

Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Plaza Surgical 
Ctr 

Operative Rept
Pre-op Dx: Left knee internal derangement. Operation 
performed: 1) Left knee diagnostic and surgical arthroscopy. 
2) Left knee partial medial and partial lateral meniscectomy. 
3) Left knee abrasive chondroplasty of the patellofemoral 
groove, medial femoral, medial tibial plateau, and lateral 
femoral and tibial plateau cartilage. Post-op Dx: 1) Evidence 
of left knee complex tear of the medial and lateral meniscus. 
2) Evidence of cartilage tears of the patellofemoral groove, 
tears of the medial femoral condyle cartilage, lateral femoral 
condyle cartilage, medial tibial plateau and lateral tibial 
plateau. Clinical Indication: Patient was taken to the 
operating room, and under adequate laryngeal mask 
anesthetic, patient1s LLE was prepped and draped in the 
usual sterile manner. Patient was given 600 mg of 
Clindamycin on a prophylaxis basis. 

05/09/08 |318, |332-
|334

Assoc Sports 
Therapy 

CC: Patient c/o left knee. Recommendation: PT 3 x/week x 4 
weeks. Disability Status: TTD. (There are illegible data on 
these pages) 

05/26/08 |386 Eastside Ortho Med 
Assoc 

Surgery Authorization Request
Dx: Medial meniscus tear. Internal derangement knee. Tx 
plan: Crutches, ice, therapy unit. Recommendation: Left knee 
arthroscopy. 

06/06/08 |318, |323-
|325, |328-
|331

Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Eastside Ortho 
Med Assoc 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
Patient has undergone arthroscopic surgery of the left knee. 
She indicates that her pain has improved significantly. She is 
now approximately six weeks since she underwent the 
surgery and has improved significantly with respect to the 
surgical procedure. She has also been in PT for the last four 
weeks and has responded favorably. Exam: Lower 
Extremities: On examination of her left knee there is 
evidence of mild tenderness. There is mild swelling. There is 
no gross erythema. There are well healed surgical 
arthroscopic portals. ROM is 0 to approximately 100 
degrees. Impression: S/p left knee arthroscopy. Discussion: I 
will recommend that patient at this time continue on an 
aggressive PT program three times a week for the next four 
weeks as well as an aggressive home exercise program to 
continue to strengthen the extremity. She will continue on 
Vicodin for pain and discomfort. I will see her back for f/u in 
four weeks time and I am hopeful she will respond to 
conservative measures. In the meantime, I will recommend 
that she continue off of work until further progress is made. 
Recommendation: PT 3 x/week x 4 weeks. 

06/18/08 |382-|384 Assoc Sports 
Therapy 

PT Evaluation
Dx: Left s/p internal derangement. Exam: Left knee: Pain 



level 4-5/10. ROM: Flexion: 0-115 degrees. Strength: 4+/5. 
Tx plan: Continue current treatment plan. (There are illegible 
data on these pages) 

07/11/08 |319-|322, 
|354

Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Eastside Ortho 
Med Assoc 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
CC: 10 weeks with left knee pain. Exam: Left knee: ROM: 
20-100 degrees. Dx: Left knee pain. Tx plan: Vicodin. PT 2 
x/week x 4 weeks. Work status: Off work. Disability Status: 
TTD. (There are illegible dates on these pages) 

08/08/08 |306, |315 Assoc Sports 
Therapy 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
CC: 14 weeks with knee surgery. Dx: Left knee post-op. Tx 
plan: Vicodin. PT 3 x/week x 4 weeks. Disability Status: 
TTD. (There are illegible dates on these pages) 

08/22/08 |379-|380, 
|387-|393

Assoc Sports 
Therapy 

Patient participated in PT sessions from 06/18/18 to 08/22/08 
in an effort to decrease pain tenderness and increase ROM 
and strength. 

08/28/08 |314 Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
CC: 16 weeks with knee f/u. 2 months severe electrical type 
pain. LLE external and LBP. Exam: Left knee: Well healed. 
Left IT band with pain. Dx: Pain with left knee. Tx plan: 
Continue Motrin. (There is illegible data on this page) 

09/05/08 |307-|313 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Eastside Ortho 
Med Assoc 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
Patient has undergone arthroscopic surgery of the left knee 
on 04/24/08. Since then, she has been placed on an 
aggressive PT program, a home exercise program and at this 
point in time indicates that her pain has improved 
significantly. She does complain of some associated pain to 
her lower back and some radiculopathy of her LLE. Exam: 
Back: On examination of her back there is evidence of mild 
tenderness, there is mild swelling. She flexes forward for 90 
degrees, extends to 35 degrees, and laterally bends to 35 
degrees bilaterally. Lower extremities: On examination of 
her left knee there is evidence of well healed surgical 
arthroscopic incisions. She flexes the knee from 0 to 125 
degrees. Impression: 1) S/p left knee arthroscopy. 2) 
Lumbosacral spine strain. 3) LLE radiculopathy. Discussion: 
Given this patient's overall findings, I would recommend that 
this patient be released to a work related position avoiding 
any prolonged periods of standing and walking, any 
squatting, climbing and pivoting type of activities. I will 
recommend that patient continue on a strengthening program 
on her own behalf for her LLE. I will also recommend that 
she continue use of Ibuprofen for pain and inflammation and 
I would like to re-examine her in four weeks time to assess 
her progress. I am hopeful that she will continue to improve 
and I will keep you informed as to her progress with 
supplemental reports. 



10/10/08 |284, |305 Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
CC: Patient c/o swelling pain worse. Dx: Left knee f/u. DJD. 
Tx plan: Motrin 500 mg. Vicodin. HEP. F/u on 4 weeks. 
(There is illegible data on this page) 

11/07/08 |303-|304 Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
CC: Left knee pain in the same. Meds Ibuprofen to get helps. 
Exam: Left knee: ROM: 15-100 degrees. Dx: Left knee pain 
with swelling. Left knee OA. Tx plan: Motrin 500 mg. 
Vicodin. Prilosec. HEP. F/u on 3 weeks. (There are illegible 
data on these pages) 

12/05/08 |245-|252 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Eastside Ortho 
Med Assoc 

Orthopedic P and S Rept
Patient has been under our care. She underwent discomfort of 
her left knee. Arthroscopic surgery of her left knee on 
04/24/07. At the time of surgery, she underwent a partial 
medial meniscectomy and an abrasive chondroplasty of the 
medial femoral condyle. Since then, she indicates that her 
pain has improved, however, not completely resolved. She 
indicates that she does have some mild. Exam: Lower 
extremities: On examination of her left knee there is evidence 
of well healed surgical arthroscopic portals. She flexes the 
knee from 0 to 125 degrees. Impression: 1) S/p left knee 
arthroscopy with partial meniscectomy. 2) S/p left knee 
abrasive chondroplasty. Discussion: At this time it is 
apparent that patient has essentially plateaued and may be 
considered P and S. She has reached a maximum level of 
improvement having undergone arthroscopic surgery and 
placed on a post-operative PT program. Work status: Given 
this patient's clinical presentation and findings, I will 
recommend that this patient be released to her previous 
occupation with no restrictions. Impairment rating: Based on 
the American Medical Association 5th Edition Guide to 
permanent impairment there is no loss of ROM noted, 
however, she did undergo a partial meniscectomy which 
corresponds to a 1% whole person impairment rating. 
Apportionment: Apportionment in this patient's case is 
apparently not indicated since patient denies any prior 
injuries of her involved knee. Subjective factors of disability: 
Her subjective complaints are rated in the range of 
intermittent minimal not exceeding that level. Objective 
factors of disability: Objectively, patient did undergo a 
partial meniscectomy as well as an abrasive chondroplasty 
and has responded favorably. Vocational rehabilitation: 
Vocational rehabilitation is also not indicated since this 
patient will be released to her previous occupation with no 
restrictions. Future medical care: Future medical care in this 
patient's case certainly is indicated given the nature of this 



patient's injury and the clinical findings and 1 would 
recommend that we grant her physician care, 
pharmacotherapy, PT and this would certainly provide her 
coverage should there be an aggravation or recurrence of the 
same similar symptoms as a result of the initial injury. 

01/23/09 |297-|302 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Eastside Ortho 
Med Assoc 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
Patient underwent arthroscopic surgery of her knee on 
04/24/08 at the Plaza Surgical Center. She underwent a 
partial medial and partial lateral meniscectomy with an 
abrasive chondroplasty of the patellofemoral groove, medial 
femoral condyle, and medial tibial plateau, lateral femoral 
and lateral tibial plateau. Since then, she was considered P 
and S on her visit of 12/05/08. In reviewing this patient's 
history, she denied any prior injuries noted of her left knee. 
However, she does give us an h/o having injured her left 
ankle in August of 2007. She was off of work for 
approximately four to five weeks, she informed us of this, 
and however, in reviewing the report by Dr. Ralph 
Gamberdella, it appears that in fact that she did sustain an 
ankle sprain which was treated by Dr. Gamberdella's 
associate Dr. Jung. As a result of having developed pain to 
her left knee was referred to Dr. Gamberdella. However, he 
does not note an acute traumatic event to the left knee other 
than pain. As a result of the pain, Dt Gamberdella awarded 
her a 7% lower extremity impairment raring based on the 
joint space narrowing of the knee and a 10% lower extremity 
impairment rating as a result of the patellofemoral joint space 
narrowing, a total of 17% which corresponds to a 7% whole 
person impairment rating. On this basis, it appears that in fact 
this patient does in fact have a preexisting underlying 
degenerative osteoarthritis of her knee with previous pain 
which apparently improved and/or resolved and at this time 
has had a recurrence of the same problem. I would apportion 
this to at least 50% present industrial injury of 11/10/07 
would be apportioned to her prior injury of her left knee as 
noted by Dr. Gamberdella. 

09/04/09 |294-|296 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Eastside Ortho 
Med Assoc 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
Patient has previously been under our care. She was last seen 
in this office on 12/05/08 and was considered P and S. Since 
then, patient has been declared P and S. She indicates that 
this past week she apparently was getting out of a friend's car 
when she attempted to do so she apparently twisted her left 
knee causing her to develop pain and discomfort of her left 
knee. She was concerned that she may have re-injured the 
knee and therefore sought medical attention under our care 
and supervision. She also indicates that she has not lost time 



from work. Wt: 213 lbs. Exam: General: Patient c/o left knee 
soreness. Lower extremities: On physica1 examination of her 
left knee reveals evidence of mild medial joint line 
tenderness. She flexes the knee from 0 to 125 degrees. X-
rays taken today reveals evidence of mild medial joint space 
narrowing noted. Impression: 1) Left knee re-injury. 2) Left 
knee evidence of mild degenerative osteoarthritis. 
Discussion: I will recommend that patient at this time be 
provided with Motrin for pain and inflam4iatioa I am hopeful 
this will relieve her acute onset of this re-injury and it appear 
that she does not have anything mote severe than a strain of 
her involved left knee, I will recommend that she continue 
working with no restrictions and I will see her back for f/u 
should her symptoms not improve in the next four to six 
weeks time. 

10/11/10 |288-|293 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Eastside Ortho 
Med Assoc 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept (PR-2)
Patient has been under our care. She has been previously 
declared P and S with an injury to her involved left knee. 
However, she was also presented with pain and discomfort of 
her lower back with associated radiculopathy to her LLE. 
She indicates that this is a new problem and is quite 
concerned. Exam: Back: On physical examination of the 
lumbar spine there is mild tenderness. She flexes forward to 
90 degrees, extends to 35 degrees, and laterally bends to 35 
degrees bilaterally. Lower extremities: Left knee exam 
reveals evidence of mild diffuse medial collateral ligament 
tenderness. She flexes the knee from 0 to 125 degrees. 
Impression: 1) S/p left knee surgical arthroscopy. 2) 
Lumbosacral spine strain with LLE radiculopathy (new 
problem). Discussion: Patient at this time has noted some 
pain and discomfort of the lower back which appears to be a 
new problem. I have discussed with patient the fact that this 
is not a continued medical problem from a previous injury 
and therefore this should be seen and treated according to 
either a new industrial injury or nonindustrial injury 
depending on patient's presentation of the problem to the 
newly treating doctor. With respect to her left knee, she does 
have some tenderness over the media] collateral ligament 
area, however, there is no evidence of any acute injury, there 
is no evidence of loss of motor or sensory function, therefore 
these is no need for any acute ongoing medical care. Patient 
will be provided with the use of an anti- inflammatory 
medication as well as an analgesic medication to ameliorate 
her level of pain and discomfort of her left knee. I will keep 
you informed as to this patient's progress should she return 
on reexamination purposes. 



01/26/11 |285-|287 Saucedo, Thomas, 
M.D.-Eastside Ortho 
Med Assoc 

Orthopedic Supplemental Rept
Patient has been under our care having previously undergone 
arthroscopic surgery of her knee. Surgery was performed on 
04/24/08. She indicates that she did well, however, she did 
have some residual soreness, this soreness has steadily 
become more pronounced. She denies any new injuries to her 
left knee. She denies any other problem to her left knee and 
indicates that she has continued to work with D'Veal Family 
Youth Svcs performing her work related activities. However, 
she does complain of increased pain of her left knee 
especially over the last few months. BP: 206/100. Exam: 
Lower extremities: On physical examination of the left knee 
there is evidence of notable medial joint line tenderness, 
there is notable swelling. There is an effusion. She has a 
positive McMurray sign and positive grind sign. There is 
notable pain and discomfort especially of the medial 
compartment of the knee. No gross laxity is noted. Motor and 
sensory function is intact distally. Diagnostic studies: X-rays 
of the left knee reveals evidence of Grade III medial 
compartment narrowing of the left knee with osteophyte 
formation noted primarily in the medial compartment. 
Impression: Left knee evidence of medial compartment 
degenerative osteoarthritis. Discussion: Given patient's 
clinical findings as well as the results of her x-rays it appears 
that she has extensive degenerative changes of the medial 
compartment of her left knee. This has progressively gotten 
worse since she had surgery three years ago and at this point 
in time it appears that the pain is quite unrelenting. I will 
recommend that she be treated conservatively at this point in 
time with the use of an anti-inflammatory medication as well 
as an intra-articular cortisone injection to minimize her pain 
and discomfort, this was provided. Patient noted immediate 
improvement of the pain and discomfort of the left knee. I 
will see her back for f/u in four weeks time. Should this 
patient's symptoms not improve or resolve significantly, she 
may require further intervention. This would entail a knee 
arthroplasty of her left knee. At this point in time I have 
discussed this in detail with patient and I will see her back 
for f/u to assess her progress in four weeks time. She will 
continue to work with no restrictions. I will keep you 
informed as noted. 

03/17/11 |263-|280 Fell Jr, Thomas W., 
M.D. 

Orthopedic Agreed Panel QME Evaluation
DOI: 08/09/07 and 11/10/07. Hx of injury: Patient first injury 
around August, 2007, when she slipped, fell and twisted her 
left ankle and her left knee. She was seen in an industrial 
clinic and treated with bracing for both of these as well as 



PT. While still healing from this injury, patient bad a second 
injury in November, 2007. She was picking up clients at 
work when she noticed that the car was rolling. She jumped 
in to pull up tension on the brake. In doing so, she fell 
striking her left knee on the ground and her right foot turned 
in. She had ongoing pain in the left knee and right ankle. She 
elevated and iced it. Because of the pain, she went to Kaiser 
emergency room where she was evaluated and had x-rays. 
She was told that she had two fractures of the right foot. She 
was placed in a Cam walker which she wore for a number of 
weeks. She then treated with Dr. Saucedo. As the right foot 
got better, she had persistent pain in the left knee. She had an 
MRI and eventually surgery of the left knee which helped the 
left knee. However, she has had residual ongoing symptoms 
of the left knee ever since the surgery. She was released in 
2008 or so by Dr. Saucedo. She returned to him a couple of 
months ago because of pain in the left knee. At that time, she 
could not use the clutch of her car. Dr. Saucedo had told her 
that she would need to get a different kind of car because of 
the clutch, but she continued to use the clutch. He took x-
rays of her knee and gave her a cortisone injection. She was 
off work for about a week. The injection helped a lot. 
However, she developed a skin burn from the topical used to 
freeze her knee prior to the injection. Dr. Saucedo told her 
she was bone on bone laterally and may need total knee 
replacement surgery in the future. Present complaints: The 
left ankle and left knee symptoms almost always occur 
together with any prolonged walking, climbing stairs, 
squatting, kneeling with cause swelling basically of the knee 
and then the ankle followed by pain. The ankle pain is medial 
and lateral. The left knee pain is diffuse peripatellar pain. 
The knee does not have any locking or buckling, but it has 
stiffness. Wt: 213 lbs. PMH: Prior injuries: Patient injured 
her left ankle a number of years ago, in the mid-90s. It was 
fractured medially and laterally- She had surgery. Ever since 
then she has had pain which became worse after the incident 
of August, 2007. Hypertension. Prior surgeries: Knee surgery 
for this injury. Prior left ankle surgery. Allergies: Penicillin. 
Social habits: Patient admits to smoking cigarettes and 
alcohol consumption. Meds: Patient is taking Lisinopril and 
Hydrochlorothiazide, Ibuprofen, Vicodin. Physician 
reviewed medical records. Exam: Left knee: Examination of 
the left knee reveals mild swelling as compared to the right. 
There are multiple well-healed arthroscopic portals. There is 
a 1.5 cm circular lesion on the superior medial aspect of the 
knee that is consistent with a first or second degree skin burn. 



There is tenderness over the anterior medial joint line and 
anterior lateral joint line with the anterior lateral joint line 
being tender. There is mild crepitus of the patellofemoral 
joint. There is moderate crepitus over the lateral joint. The 
left knee is in valgus when compared to the right. ROM of 
the left knee reveals extension to 0 degrees and flexion to 
130 degrees. The left knee is stable to anteroposterior and 
mediolateral. Stressors taking into consideration the valgus 
deformity. Ankles/feet: Examination of the left ankle reveals 
mild swelling about the left ankle medially and laterally. 
There are well-healed medial and lateral scars. Diffuse 
tenderness is noted medially and laterally of the ankle. Pain 
with just the slightest motion of the ankle. ROM of the ankle 
reveals dorsiflexion is to 0 degrees and plantar flexion is to 5 
degrees. ROM of the right ankle and foot shows dorsiflexion 
is to 15 degrees and plantar flexion is to 40 degrees. ROM is 
without pain. The right ankle is stable to yams and valgus 
stressors in the neutral and plantar-flexed positions. X-rays 
of the left ankle and X-rays were also obtained of the left 
knee were reviewed. Dx: 1) Sprain/strain of the left knee 
aggravating degenerative arthritis of the left knee. Status post 
arthroscopic partial lateral and medial meniscectomy 2) 
Sprain of the left ankle temporarily aggravating significant 
pre-existing arthritis of the left ankle. 3) Fracture of the right 
foot, fourth and fifth metatarsals healed. Discussion: This 
patient suffered two injuries, one on 08/09/07 and one on 
11/10/07. Patient was doing well as far as her left knee was 
concerned even though she had pre-existing arthritis until she 
suffered the injury of August, 2007, and further injured it in 
November, 2007. With regards to the left ankle, it has always 
given her pain, well prior to the two work incidents. She 
suffered an injury to the left ankle back in the mid-90s and 
had ORIF. She had residual symptoms. She then sprained it 
and had temporary increased pain with the work incidents. 
However, I expect that most of the symptoms now are 
residuals of her arthritis given the fact that she has significant 
limitation of motion of the ankle. A sprained ankle would not 
cause this type of limitation of motion. She would have 
excessive motion. There is no instability of the ankle. Even 
the slightest motion of the ankle causes pain so all of the pain 
is coming from the ankle joint. Then I asked patient about 
that and mentioned the fact that I thought that the knee pain 
aggravated the arthritis and the ankle pain would probably be 
present absent the work injuries. She tended to agree that the 
arthritis of the knee was the one that was really aggravated 
by the work incidents and that the left knee really wasn't 



hurting her and the left ankle has always given her problems 
since the prior ankle surgery. She did suffer a right foot 
fractures in the 11/10/07 incident. However, the right foot 
fractures have healed completely with no residuals. Patient 
had a flare-up of symptoms that precipitated a lot of this, 
needing an injection which settled down her knee, but it is 
still symptomatic. Fortunately, individuals with valgus knees, 
that is, arthritis in the lateral aspect of the knee can tolerate a 
lot of arthritis without need for total knee replacement. 
Disability Status: Patient is at MMI from her injuries. AMA 
impairment: Using the AMA Guides to the Evaluation of 
Permanent Impairment, Fifth Edition:Right foot - The 
fracture is well healed without any impairment. Left ankle - 
The ankle is rated according to arthritis Table 17-31. This 
patient has 0 mm of joint space which is a 30% lower 
extremity impairment. Left knee - With regard to the left 
knee, she has approximately 2 mm of joint space on the left 
side. Using Table 17-31, this is a 20% lower extremity 
impairment. For the left knee, patient is also rated according 
to Table 17-33. Because she has partial medial and partial 
lateral meniscectomy, she has a 10% lower extremity 
impairment. This gives her a 30% lower extremity 
impairment for the left knee. Combining the 30% lower 
extremity impairment for the left knee with the 30% lower 
extremity impairment for the left ankle, using page 504 of the 
Guides, gives her a combined total of 51% lower extremity 
impairment which using Table 17-3, gives her a total of 20% 
whole person impairment. Future medical care: Left knee - 
Allowance should be made for repeat orthopedic visits for 
her left knee including but not limited to evaluations, x-rays, 
corticosteroid injections. For more lasting relief than the 
corticosteroid injections, viscous supplementation such 
Synvisc would be beneficial. Should the left knee symptoms 
become such that they interfere significantly interfere with 
her quality of life, then she would be a total knee 
replacement candidate. She is not a knee replacement 
candidate at this time, however, this could change in the next 
few years. X-rays findings are not indicative of the need for 
total knee replacement. Only the pain and its effect on the 
quality of living is an indication for a knee replacement. Left 
ankle - with regards to the left ankle, any further care of the 
left ankle would be treatment of her pre-existing arthritis of 
the left ankle, not the injury of August, 2007 or November, 
2007. Right foot - None. Work status: She may do her 
present job without any formal restrictions. However in the 
open labor market, patient would be precluded from more 



than occasional squatting, kneeling, and precluded from any 
type of climbing and more than occasional use of stairs. 
Causation and Apportionment: With regards to her right foot, 
this was injured in the November 2007 work incident and 
100% of any residual disability is due to the incident of 
November, 2007. With regards to the left knee, prior to the 
work incidents, she was asymptomatic in the left knee even 
though she had arthritis. She injured the left knee in both the 
819/07 and the 11/10/07 work incidents. The arthritis appears 
to have gotten worse since the injuries. Based upon these 
records and examination today, I would apportion 20% to the 
pre-existing pathology and the remaining 80% to the 
aggravation of the pre-existing pathology, further 
sprain/strain and tears of the menisci as a result of the two 
work incidents of August and November, 2007. I cannot 
separate these two as to which one caused the tear of the 
meniscus and which one caused more injury to the knee; I 
put them together as one injury. With regard to the left ankle, 
while she has temporarily aggravated the left ankle in the 
08/09/07 fall and 11/10/07 incident, she also had pre-existing 
arthritis from a prior injury that required surgery. At this 
point, any residual is 100% apportioned to the pre-existing 
arthritis. I think she had a temporary aggravation of the left 
ankle arthritis due to the sprains, but this settled back down. 
Patient's present complaints and need for treatment of the left 
ankle would be present absent the work injury. This is based 
upon the fact that she has significant limitation of motion of 
the ankle indicating severe arthritis. A sprain in the ankle 
would cause laxity and looseness of the ankle, not tightness 
of the ankle. This does not appear to be residual of the ankle 
sprain. 

03/23/11 |364-|365 Synergy Imaging Ctr Radiology/Diagnostics
X-ray of Left Knee. Clinical Indication: Evaluate for 
degenerative joint disease. Impression: Findings compatible 
with degenerative joint disease primarily involving the lateral 
compartment. X-ray of Left Ankle. Clinical Indication: DJD. 
Findings: The bones an notable for an old fracture involving 
the distal left fibula and medial malleolus with internal 
fixation. The lateral view reveals marked narrowing of The 
mortise joint spaces compatible with severe degenerative 
disease. The remainder of the bones is unremarkable. The 
soft tissues are notable for both medial and lateral soft tissue 
swelling. Impression: 1) Old fractures with internal fixation. 
2) Severe degenerative disease of the mortise joint. 3) Soft 
tissue swelling. 



11/07/20 |349-|350, 
|353, |362

Health Care Partners 
Med Grp 

Referral Slip
Dx: Right foot. Soreness left ankle. Contusion left knee. 
Recommendation: Ortho evaluation and treatment. (There are 
illegible data on these pages) 



Records Categories

Copy Service Paperwork |
1

Start of Records |
11

Claims |
12

Reports |
238

Doctor's Notes |
283

Radiology/Diagnostics |
363

General/Med |
375



Copy Service Paperwork
SCI000001



SCI000002



SCI000003



SCI000004



SCI000005



SCI000006



SCI000007



SCI000008



SCI000009



SCI000010



Start of Records
SCI000011



Claims
SCI000012



0
2
 
 
3
2
4
0
2
2
 
 
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
1
 
 
0
0
2
 
 
3
7
8
 
 
0
5
1
7
0
3
6
0

8083

INJURED NAME: Floreen Rooks CLAIM NUMBER: 05170360

DECLARATION

I hereby declare under penalty of perjury that the following statements are true, to the best
of my knowledge and belief.

I am the custodian of records for State Compensation Insurance Fund. The records made
available are all records called for in the attached Subpoena which State Compensation
Insurance Fund is legally obligated to produce. All other records in State Compensation

Insurance Fund's possession are privileged information.

SA Admin Support
________________________________________
Signature

November 9, 2020
_________________________________________
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